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as gardeners, we hold the
power to brighten our world
world by planting the seeds for
positive change. 

gardener
/ɡärd(ə)ner/

noun
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our joyful feelings, thoughts
and emotions(baking cookies,
snuggling, dancing, family,
friends...)

flowers
/ˈflou(ə)rs/

noun
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our negative/uncomfortable
thoughts, feelings and
emotions(sad, scared, mad,
embarrassed, overwhelmed...)

Weeds
/wēdz/

noun
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the most powerful gardening
tool we have- talking about our
'weeds' with someone we trust
(parent, teacher, guardian,
counselor...)

pull your weeds
/po͝ ol-yôr-wēdz/

phrase
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positive activies and exercises
we do to help us feel confident
and calm (deep breathing,
grounding exercises, arts &
crafts, mindfulness activites...)

gardening tools
/ˈɡärd(ə)niNG-to͞ ols/

phrase
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what we learn about ourselves
and others when we pull our
weeds. the positive ways to
help us move forward and
grow.  

Seeds
/sēds/

noun
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